City of Akron

501 Municipal Bldg.
Purchasing Office
166 S. High St.
Akron Oh 44308

DATE: 10/20/16

TABULATION SHEET
SEALED BID
OPEN 10:00 A.M.

BID #R2437-2231-16

Number of Bid Notices mailed - 9
Number of Bids Received - 3
Opened by: Kim Herron
Witnessed by: Dawn Evans

ITEM: ONE-TON DUMP-PLOW -PARKS

CENWELD
230 E PORTAGE TRAIL
CUYAHOGA FALLS, OHIO 44221

CONCORD ROAD EQUIPMENT
348 CHESTER ST
PAINESVILLE, OHIO 44077

FALLSWAY EQUIPMENT CO
1277 DEVALERA AVE
AKRON, OHIO 44310

LF DONNELL
7955 MARKET ST
YOUNGSTOWN, OHIO 44512

F.0.B. DELIVERED TO THE CITY OF AKRON MOTOR
EQUIPMENT, 1428 TRIPLETT BLVD. #3, AKRON, OHIO

PART A (CAB & CHASSIS

1. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS, 2017 OR

NEWER HEAVY-DUTY CONVENTIONAL CREW CAB

AND CHASSIS WITH 9' DUMP BODY
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

PART A OPTION

1-A. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS, FRONT

AXLE
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

PART B (BODY/COMPONENTS FOR 9' DUMP BODY)
1. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS, 304 STAINLESS
STEEL DUMP BODY

MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

2. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS, LOW MOUNT

HOIST
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

HEIGHT FROM TOP OF TRUCK FRAME TO
UNDERSIDE OF DUMP BODY FLOOR

3. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS, DOME LIGHT

MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

4. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

HOPPER
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

5. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS, TRUCK

HYDRAULIC SYSTEM
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

6. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

CONVEYOR GEARCASE
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

7. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

CONVEYOR
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

8. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS

FEEDGATE
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

9. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

SPINNER
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

10. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

SPINNER CHUTE ASSEMBLY
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

11. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

CONVEYOR/SPINNER DRIVE
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

12. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

TRAILER HITCH
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

** Price changed on bid form, but
not initialed by vendor.

wox

GALION
103U

CHAMPION
G61ST

DEWEZEE
C-PUMP FOR DIESEL

MEYER
MDU944SS

BIUERS
5/8 H PLATE

No Bid

No Bid

$11,861.64

$1,950.75

No Bid

$8,032.50

$8,186.00

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

$544.41

CONCORD RD EQUIP MFG
PACKAGE 64343

TBEI
LB-500

12

SIGNAL-STAT
77-570

MUNCIE
VARIOUS

SWENSON SPREADER
MDV-944-HSS

SWENSON SPREADER
MDV-944-HSS

SWENSON SPREADER
MDV-944-HSS

SWENSON SPREADER
MDV-944-HSS

SWENSON SPREADER
MDV-944-HSS

SWENSON SPREADER
MDV-944-HSS

SWENSON SPREADER
MDV-944-HSS

CONCORD RD EQUIP MFG
CRE-TH

No Bid

No Bid

$38,334.31

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

DURACLASS
MAD SDYB-316 9X7 304 STAINLESS

DURACLASS
1520

125

SIGNAL STAT
77-570

CERTIFIED POWER
MUNCIE

BUYERS
1400460SSH

BUYERS
2" BALL/PINTLE

No Bid

No Bid

$14,059.00

INCLUDED

$189.00

$4,800.00

$7,000.00

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

$600.00

FORD - CHASSIS ONLY, NO BODY
FORD F-450

FORD

$46,390.00

INCLUDED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of Akron

501 Municipal Bldg.
Purchasing Office
166 S. High St.
Akron Oh 44308

DATE: 10/20/16

TABULATION SHEET
SEALED BID
OPEN 10:00 A.M.

BID #R3738/3739-16

ITEM: CREW CAB ONE-TON DUMP BODY-PARKS

CENWELD
230 E PORTAGE TRAIL
CUYAHOGA FALLS, OHIO 44221

CONCORD ROAD EQUIPMENT
348 CHESTER ST
PAINESVILLE, OHIO 44077

FALLSWAY EQUIPMENT CO
1277 DEVALERA AVE
AKRON, OHIO 44310

LF DONNELL
7955 MARKET ST
YOUNGSTOWN, OHIO 44512

13. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

TRAILER BRAKE CONTROLLER
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

14. ONE (1) EACH, MORE OR LESS,

PLOW
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

15. ONE (1)EACH, MORE OR LESS,

RUSTPROOFING
MANUFACTURER'S NAME
MAKE & MODEL NUMBER

PAYMENT TERMS

YOUR DELIVERY PROMISE

ETHICS REGULATION - ARE YOU AWARE OF
ANY INTEREST OR POTENTIAL INTEREST IN

THIS CONTRACT THAT MAY BE HAD BY AN
INDIVIDUAL WHO IS CONNECTED TO THE CITY

EA

EA

EA

TEKONSHA
9035

MEYER
LP-9

ZIEBART
ZIEBART

NET 30

90 DAYS AFTER TRUCK ARRIVES

$263.18

$4,938.56

$495.00

TEKONSHA
9035

MEYER PRODUCTS
LP 9.0

ZIEBART
N/A

NET 30 DAYS

90-120 DAYS AFTER CHASSIS

$171.20

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

TEKONSHA
9035

MEYER
LP-9

ZIEBART
ZIEBART

NET 15 DAYS

APPROXIMATELY 120 DAYS

$319.00

$6,000.00

$500.00

INCLUDED
FORD
No Bid
No Bid
NET 30 DAYS

14-16 WEEKS FROM TIME OF PURCHASE ORDER

OF AKRON? NO NO NO NO
HAVE YOU COMPLETED THE REQUIRED E.E.O.

FORM FOR THIS BID? YES YES YES YES
This tabulation is for information purposes only. If and when an award is made, the LOWEST and BEST bidder will be notified. KH/dme




